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1. The number of licenced HMOs which appeared on the council’s register,
broken down by council tax band.

The Council does not hold this information as Council Tax records do not record that a property is a licensed HMO

2.The number of all residential properties in the council’s area, broken down by
council tax band (including HMOs and non-HMOs).

Exempt: Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (Information Accessible by other means). This information is
available via the Valuation Office Agencies website where you can view the band of each property on the list. This can be

found at https://www.gov.uk/council-tax-bands

3. Number of new initial HMO licence applications made.

4. Number of new HMO licence applications rejected.

5. Number of new HMO licence applications approved/issued.

6. Number of renewal HMO licence applications made.

7. Number of renewal HMO licence applications rejected.

8. Number of renewal HMO licence applications approved/issued.

9. Number of HMO licences which expired.

10. Average maximum permitted occupants for HMOs on the register for the
specified year.

11. Average maximum households for HMOs on the register for the specified
year.

12. The highest maximum permitted occupants for an HMO on the register for
the specified year.

13. The highest maximum households for an HMO on the register for the
specified year.

14. The associated address for question 12.

15. The associated address for question 13.

The Council moved to a new software system in 2024 and we are unable to report on the data
held in the previous system. The Council therefore does not hold the data for these years.
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This information is
available online at
https://www.dover.gov.u
k/Housing/Private-
Sector-Housing/Houses-
in-Multiple-
Occupation/Licensed-
Houses-in-Multiple-
Occupation.aspx
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available online at
https://www.dover.gov.u
k/Housing/Private-
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